North Thoresby, Waithe and Grainsby Parish Council

Request for Information Decision

Date of request for internal review: 07/08/2025
Date of internal review decision: 09/10/2025
Request:

| request that you provide the following information electronically to me at the following email

address [N

1. Which councillor, employee or other person was given control of the parish council
website

2. What date this person was given control of the parish council website

3. What controls were in place to ensure any changes were controlled and only made
as per the resolutions approved by the parish council in public session

4. What date the council became inquorate due to resignations

5. Who was given control of the parish council website when the council became
inquorate

6. What controls were in place to ensure no changes were made to the parish council
website until the council again became quorate and had elected the required 2
statutory officers of Chair and Proper Officer and was able to conduct business

Decision:

In accordance with Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, you are advised
that North Thoresby, Waithe and Grainsby Parish Council holds recorded information that
falls within the description specified in your request for one of your requests. It does not hold
information for five of your requests.

The Freedom of Information Act gives a right of access to recorded information held by the
Parish Council. It does not require the council to create new information, provide
explanations, or answer questions.

The council does not hold this information.

The council does not hold this information.

The council does not hold this information.

The council is quorate with four councillors. At the 2 January 2025 there was
insufficient councillors to make that meeting quorate. The council became quorate on
27 January 2025.

The council does not hold this information.

The council does not hold this information.
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If information has been refused, please treat this as a Refusal Notice for the purposes of the
Act.

Your right of appeal:

If you are not content with the outcome of your complaint and the Internal Review you may
apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information Commissioner
can be contacted at: The Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF
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North Thoresby, Waithe and Grainsby Parish Council

Most of the information that we provide in response to the Freedom of Information act
2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 requests will be subject to copyright
protection. In most cases the copyright will be owned by the Council. The copyright in other
information may be owned by another person or organisation, as indicated by the
information itself.
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